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Signed in Washington, DC, on April 23, 
2025. 
Treena V. Garrett, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, U.S. 
Department of Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2025–07270 Filed 4–25–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OAR–2025–0085; FRL–12667–01– 
OAR; EPA ICR No. 2691.03, OMB Control 
Number 2060–0740] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed Information 
Collection Request; Comment 
Request; Renewable Fuel Standard 
(RFS) Program: RFS Annual Rules 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) is planning to submit an 
information collection request (ICR), 
Renewable Fuel Standard (RFS) 
Program: RFS Annual Rules (EPA ICR 
Number 2691.03, OMB Control Number 
2060–0740) to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) for review and 
approval in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act. Before doing 
so, EPA is soliciting public comments 
on specific aspects of the proposed 
information collection as described 
below. This is a proposed extension of 
the ICR, which is currently approved 
through October 31, 2025. This notice 
allows for 60 days for public comments. 
DATES: Comments must be submitted on 
or before June 27, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
referencing Docket ID Number EPA– 
HQ–OAR–2025–0085, to EPA online 
using www.regulations.gov (our 
preferred method), by email to a-and-r- 
docket@epa.gov, or by mail to: EPA 
Docket Center, Environmental 
Protection Agency, Mail Code 28221T, 
1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20460. EPA’s policy is 
that all comments received will be 
included in the public docket without 
change including any personal 
information provided, unless the 
comment includes profanity, threats, 
information claimed to be Confidential 
Business Information (CBI) or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Anne-Marie C. Pastorkovich, Office of 
Air and Radiation, Mail Code 6405A, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 

Pennsylvania Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460; telephone number: 202–343– 
9623; email address: pastorkovich.anne- 
marie@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a 
proposed extension of the ICR, which is 
currently approved through October 31, 
2025. An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid OMB 
control number. 

This document allows 60 days for 
public comments. Supporting 
documents, which explain in detail the 
information that the EPA will be 
collecting, are available in the public 
docket for this ICR. The docket can be 
viewed online at www.regulations.gov 
or in person at the EPA Docket Center, 
WJC West, Room 3334, 1301 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC. 
The telephone number for the Docket 
Center is 202–566–1744. For additional 
information about EPA’s public docket, 
visit http://www.epa.gov/dockets. 

Pursuant to section 3506(c)(2)(A) of 
the PRA, EPA is soliciting comments 
and information to enable it to: (i) 
evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (ii) evaluate the 
accuracy of the Agency’s estimate of the 
burden of the proposed collection of 
information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 
(iii) enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (iv) minimize the burden 
of the collection of information on those 
who are to respond, including through 
the use of appropriate forms of 
information technology. EPA will 
consider the comments received and 
amend the ICR as appropriate. The final 
ICR package will then be submitted to 
OMB for review and approval. At that 
time, EPA will issue another Federal 
Register notice to announce the 
submission of the ICR to OMB and the 
opportunity to submit additional 
comments to OMB. 

Abstract: This ICR is for provisions 
regarding biointermediates in the 
Renewable Fuel Standard (RFS) 
program. A ‘‘biointermediate’’ is 
produced from a renewable biomass 
feedstock at a biointermediate 
production facility and is not itself a 
renewable fuel; the biointermediate will 
be processed into a renewable fuel at a 
subsequent renewable fuel production 
facility. The biointermediate provisions 
were included in the EPA’s finale 
rulemaking to establish RFS volume 

standards for 2020, 2021, and 2022 (87 
FR 39600, July 1, 2022). 

The recordkeeping and reporting 
requirements allow the EPA to monitor 
compliance of biointermediate 
producers, renewable identification 
number (RIN) generators who are 
renewable fuel producers who use 
biointermediates, biointermediate 
importers, and specific third parties 
(e.g., quality assurance plan, or QAP, 
providers). This ICR is related to the 
general collection related to RFS, which 
bears OMB Control No. 2060–0725 
(expiring November 30, 2025). 

Form Numbers: RFS0107 (5900–631), 
RFS0602 (5900–290), RFS0702 (5900– 
289), RFS0801 (5900–293), RFS0902 
(5900–278), RFS2001 (5900–633), 
RFS2101 (5900–634), RFS2201 (5900– 
636), RFS2301 (5900–636), RFS2400 
(5900–361), RFS4000 (5900–529). 

Respondents/affected entities: 
Biointermediate producers, RIN 
generators (renewable fuel producers), 
biointermediate importers, third parties 
(including QAP providers). 

Respondent’s obligation to respond: 
mandatory under 40 CFR parts 80 and 
1090. 

Estimated number of respondents: 
926 (total). 

Frequency of response: quarterly, 
annually, on occasion. 

Total estimated burden: 21,942 hours 
(per year). Burden is defined at 5 CFR 
1320.03(b). 

Total estimated cost: $1,556,191 (per 
year), which includes $0 annualized 
capital or operation & maintenance 
costs. 

Changes in the estimates: There is a 
decrease of 145,443 hours in the total 
estimated respondent burden compared 
with the ICR currently approved by 
OMB. This decrease is due to far fewer 
parties who have actually registered as 
biointermediate producers than the 
original estimates anticipated in the RFS 
final rule for 2020–2022 as a potential 
upper limit. Since the initial estimates 
were made, we now know that very few 
parties (far fewer than 10) have 
registered as biointermediate producers, 
although we anticipated as many as 60 
might register at the start of the 
program. Similarly, we now know from 
registrations that very few parties (far 
fewer than 10) have registered as RIN 
generators related to biointermediates, 
although we anticipated as many as 90 
at the start. We have readjusted our 
estimates to reflect the reality of 
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participation in the first three years of 
this ICR. 

Byron Bunker, 
Director, Implementation, Analysis and 
Compliance Division. 
[FR Doc. 2025–06877 Filed 4–25–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2025–0077; FRL–12476– 
02–OCSPP] 

Certain New Chemicals or Significant 
New Uses; Statements of Findings— 
February 2025 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Toxic Substances Control 
Act (TSCA) requires EPA to publish in 
the Federal Register a statement of its 
findings after its review of certain TSCA 
submissions when EPA makes a finding 
that a new chemical substance or 
significant new use is not likely to 
present an unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment. Such 
statements apply to premanufacture 
notices (PMNs), microbial commercial 
activity notices (MCANs), and 
significant new use notices (SNUNs) 
submitted to EPA under TSCA. This 
document presents statements of 
findings made by EPA on such 
submissions during the period from 
February 1 to February 28, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: The docket for this action, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2025–0077, is 
available online at https://
www.regulations.gov. Additional 
information about dockets generally, 
along with instructions for visiting the 
docket in-person, is available at https:// 
www.epa.gov/dockets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 

For technical information: Rebecca 
Edelstein, New Chemical Division 
(7405M), Office of Pollution Prevention 
and Toxics, Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20460–0001; telephone 
number: (202) 564–1667 email address: 
edelstein.rebecca@epa.gov. 

For general information: The TSCA- 
Hotline, ABVI-Goodwill, 422 South 
Clinton Ave., Rochester, NY 14620; 
telephone number: (202) 554–1404; 
email address: TSCA-Hotline@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Executive Summary 

A. Does this action apply to me? 

This action provides information that 
is directed to the public in general. 

B. What action is the Agency taking? 

This document lists the statements of 
findings made by EPA after review of 
submissions under TSCA section 5(a) 
that certain new chemical substances or 
significant new uses are not likely to 
present an unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment. This 
document presents statements of 
findings made by EPA during the 
applicable period. 

C. What is the Agency’s authority for 
taking this action? 

TSCA section 5(a)(3) requires EPA to 
review a submission under TSCA 
section 5(a) and make specific findings 
pertaining to whether the substance may 
present unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment. Among those 
potential findings is that the chemical 
substance or significant new use is not 
likely to present an unreasonable risk of 
injury to health or the environment per 
TSCA Section 5(a)(3)(C). 

TSCA section 5(g) requires EPA to 
publish in the Federal Register a 
statement of its findings after its review 
of a submission under TSCA section 
5(a) when EPA makes a finding that a 
new chemical substance or significant 
new use is not likely to present an 
unreasonable risk of injury to health or 
the environment. Such statements apply 
to PMNs, MCANs, and SNUNs 
submitted to EPA under TSCA section 
5. 

Anyone who plans to manufacture 
(which includes import) a new chemical 
substance for a non-exempt commercial 
purpose and any manufacturer or 
processor wishing to engage in a use of 
a chemical substance designated by EPA 
as a significant new use must submit a 
notice to EPA at least 90 days before 
commencing manufacture of the new 
chemical substance or before engaging 
in the significant new use. 

The submitter of a notice to EPA for 
which EPA has made a finding of ‘‘not 
likely to present an unreasonable risk of 
injury to health or the environment’’ 
may commence manufacture of the 
chemical substance or manufacture or 
processing for the significant new use 
notwithstanding any remaining portion 
of the applicable review period. 

II. Statements of Findings Under TSCA 
Section 5(a)(3)(C) 

In this unit, EPA identifies the PMNs, 
MCANs and SNUNs for which EPA has 
made findings under TSCA section 
5(a)(3)(C) that the new chemical 
substances or significant new uses are 
not likely to present an unreasonable 
risk of injury to health or the 
environment. For the findings made 
during this period, the following list 
provides the EPA case number assigned 
to the TSCA section 5(a) submission and 
the chemical identity (generic name if 
the specific name is claimed as 
confidential). 

• J–25–0001, Biofuel producing 
Saccharomyces cerevisiae modified, 
genetically stable (Generic Name). 

• J–25–0002, Strain of Escherichia 
coli modified with genetically stable, 
plasmid-borne DNA for the production 
of plasmid-borne DNA (Generic Name). 

• P–24–0099, Saturated and 
unsaturated hydrocarbon waxes, 
oxidized, polymers with alkenoic acid, 
alkanedioic acid, substituted 
carbomonocycle, alkyl alkenoate, 
alkenyl substituted heteromonocycle, 
alkylene glycol, alkyl alkenoate, 
alkenedioic acid, polyalkylene glycol 
ether with substituted carbomonocycle 
(alkylidene)bis-, polyalkylene glycol 
ether with substituted carbomonocycle 
(alkylidene)bis-, alkanoic acid, alkyl 
alkenoate, disubstituted 
carbomonocycle, substituted 
heteropolycycle, alkyl peroxide- 
initiated (Generic Name). 

• P–24–0161, Fats and glyceridic oils, 
camelina sativa. Definition: Extractives 
and their physically modified 
derivatives. It consists primarily of the 
glycerides of the fatty acids docosenoic, 
eicosenoic, linoleic, linolenic, oleic, 
palmitic and stearic. (Camelina sativa); 
CASRN: 943248–37–1. 

To access EPA’s decision document 
describing the basis of the ‘‘not likely to 
present an unreasonable risk’’ finding 
made by EPA under TSCA section 
5(a)(3)(C), lookup the specific case 
number at https://www.epa.gov/ 
reviewing-new-chemicals-under-toxic- 
substances-control-act-tsca/chemicals- 
determined-not-likely. 

Authority: 15 U.S.C. 2601 et seq. 

Dated: April 21, 2025. 
Shari Z. Barash, 
Director, New Chemicals Division, Office of 
Pollution Prevention and Toxics. 
[FR Doc. 2025–07300 Filed 4–25–25; 8:45 am] 
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