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(5) Technical Assistance (TA) Post 
Event form. This form is distributed to 
technical assistance participants at the 
end of the TA event. This form asks 
approximately 30 questions of each 
individual that participated in the TA 
event. TA participants are asked to 
report demographic information, 
education, profession, field of study, 
status of certification or licensure, 
workplace role, employment setting, 

and satisfaction with the quality of the 
event and event materials, and to assess 
their level of skills in the topic area. No 
revisions are being made to the form. 
CSAT is proposing to continue to use 
the form as is. 

The information collected on the 
ATTC forms will assist CSAT in 
documenting the numbers and types of 
participants in ATTC events, describing 
the extent to which participants report 

improvement in their clinical 
competency, and which method is most 
effective in disseminating knowledge to 
various audiences. This type of 
information is crucial to support CSAT 
in complying with GPRA reporting 
requirements and will inform future 
development of knowledge 
dissemination activities. 

The chart below summarizes the 
annualized burden for this project. 

Type of respondent Number of 
respondents 

Responses 
per 

respondent 

Total 
responses 

Hours per 
response 

Total annual 
burden hours 

Hourly wage 
cost Total hour cost 

ATTC Faculty/Staff: 
Event Description 

Form .................. 250 1 250 .25 62.50 $20.64 $1,290 
Meeting and Technical 

Assistance Partici-
pants: 

Post-Event Form ... 5,000 1 5,000 .12 600 20.64 12,384 

Follow-up Form ..... Covered under CSAT Government Performance and Results Act (GPRA) Customer Satisfaction form (OMB # 0930– 
0197) 

Training Participants: 
Post-Event Form ... 30,000 1 30,000 .16 4,800 20.64 99,072 
Follow-up Form ..... 7,500 1 7,500 .16 1,200 20.64 24,768 

Total ............... 42,750 ........................ 42,750 ........................ 6,662.50 ........................ 137,514 

Written comments and 
recommendations concerning the 
proposed information collection should 
be sent by September 21, 2016 to the 
SAMHSA Desk Officer at the Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB). To ensure timely receipt of 
comments, and to avoid potential delays 
in OMB’s receipt and processing of mail 
sent through the U.S. Postal Service, 
commenters are encouraged to submit 
their comments to OMB via email to: 
OIRA_Submission@omb.eop.gov. 
Although commenters are encouraged to 
send their comments via email, 
commenters may also fax their 
comments to: 202–395–7285. 
Commenters may also mail them to: 
Office of Management and Budget, 
Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, New Executive Office Building, 
Room 10102, Washington, DC 20503. 

Summer King, 

Statistician. 
[FR Doc. 2016–19926 Filed 8–19–16; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Substance Abuse and Mental Health 
Services Administration 

Notice of Meeting 

Pursuant to Public Law 92–463, 
notice is hereby given that the 
Substance Abuse and Mental Health 
Services Administration’s (SAMHSA) 
Center for Substance Abuse Prevention 
(CSAP) National Advisory Council will 
meet on August 23, 2016, 4:30 p.m.– 
5:00 p.m., in Rockville, MD. 

The meeting will include the review, 
discussion, and evaluation of grant 
applications reviewed by the Initial 
Review Group, and involve an 
examination of confidential financial 
and business information as well as 
personal information concerning the 
applicants. Therefore, these meetings 
will be closed to the public as 
determined by the SAMHSA 
Administrator, in accordance with Title 
5 U.S.C. 552b(c)(4) and (c)(6); and 5 
U.S.C. App. 2, Section 10(d). 

This notice is published less than 15 
days prior to the start of the announced 
meeting, in accordance with 41 CFR 
102–3.150(b), in order to enable the 
review of an additional Strategic 
Prevention Framework Partnerships for 
Success grant application, and 

applications for SAMSHA’s Tribal 
Behavioral Health Grants program. 
These grant applications were not ready 
for discussion during the July 25th NAC 
Review, and both grant programs use 
Fiscal Year 2016 annual appropriations. 
Therefore, it is necessary to review these 
grant programs as soon as possible so 
that SAMSHA can award grant funds to 
successful applicants prior to the end of 
the Fiscal Year. 

Committee name: Substance Abuse 
and Mental Health Services 
Administration, Center for Substance 
Abuse Prevention National Advisory 
Council. 

Date/time/type: August 23, 2016, 4:30 
p.m.–5:00 p.m. (CLOSED). 

Place: SAMHSA Building, 5600 
Fishers Lane, Rockville, MD 20857. 

Contact: Matthew J. Aumen, 
Designated Federal Officer, SAMHSA/ 
CSAP National Advisory Council, 5600 
Fishers Lane, Rockville, MD 20857, 
Email: Matthew.Aumen@
samhsa.hhs.gov. 

Charles LoDico, 

Senior Chemist/Toxicologist, SAMHSA. 
[FR Doc. 2016–19989 Filed 8–19–16; 8:45 am] 
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