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information about EPA’s public docket, 
visit www.epa.gov/dockets. 

Abstract: Information collected as part 
of this information collection request 
(ICR) is used to issue operating permits 
and manage the CAM program. The 
operating permit program requires 
owners or operators of units that emit 
air pollutants to submit annual 
compliance certifications and 
monitoring results at least semi- 
annually, and to report deviations 
promptly, but no implementation 
guidance is provided within the 
operating permit program. The CAM 
program ensures sources that use active 
air emission control devices pay 
attention to those devices by monitoring 
their performance on an ongoing basis. 
The CAM rule establishes the 
requirements to implement that 
monitoring for the operating permit 
program in a cost-effective manner. 

Form Numbers: None. 
Respondents/affected entities: 

Owners and operators of pollutant- 
specific emission units. 

Respondent’s obligation to respond: 
Mandatory (40 CFR part 64). 

Estimated number of respondents: 
22,153 (total). 

Frequency of response: Semiannually. 
Total estimated burden: 23,510 hours 

(per year). Burden is defined at 5 CFR 
1320.3(b). 

Total estimated cost: $2,423,000 (per 
year) which includes $0 annualized 
capital or operation & maintenance 
costs. 

Changes in the Estimates: There is an 
overall decrease of 1,080 hours in the 
total estimated respondent burden 
compared with the ICR currently 
approved by OMB. This decrease is due 
to a correction of mathematical errors 
found in the previous ICR renewal. 
While the total estimated annual burden 
decreased, the total annual cost 
increased due to updated labor rates 
from the currently approved ICR. 

The CAM program was designed to 
ensure monitoring provisions associated 
with the prevention of significant 
deterioration (PSD) program were 
included in the Title V permits and 
updated as necessary. The owners or 
operators were required to develop 
monitoring plans for sources with active 
control devices. The agency envisioned 
that, over time, all the title V permits 
would be issued and would require 
CAM rule requirements. Current burden 
reduction for the CAM rule is based on 
complete issuance of title V permits, 
meaning no additional sources with 
active control devices need CAM plans; 
only ongoing, not new, CAM is needed. 
Since there are no new CAM plans, only 
review of existing CAM plans, the 

renewal review hours drop. No changes 
to the CAM rule keep costs the same 
(i.e., no increase in burden). Moreover, 
familiarity with existing CAM plan 
requirements should reduce source and 
regulatory review burden. 

Courtney Kerwin, 
Director, Regulatory Support Division. 
[FR Doc. 2024–01677 Filed 1–26–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FARM CREDIT ADMINISTRATION 

Sunshine Act Meetings 

TIME AND DATE: 10 a.m., Thursday, 
February 8, 2024. 
PLACE: You may observe this meeting in 
person at 1501 Farm Credit Drive, 
McLean, Virginia 22102–5090, or 
virtually. If you would like to observe, 
at least 24 hours in advance, visit 
FCA.gov, select ‘‘Newsroom,’’ then 
select ‘‘Events.’’ From there, access the 
linked ‘‘Instructions for board meeting 
visitors’’ and complete the described 
registration process. 
STATUS: This meeting will be open to the 
public. 
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: The 
following matters will be considered: 
• Approval of Minutes for January 11, 

2024 
• Risk-Weighting of High Volatility 

Commercial Real Estate Final Rule 
CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
If you need more information or 
assistance for accessibility reasons, or 
have questions, contact Ashley 
Waldron, Secretary to the Board. 
Telephone: 703–883–4009. TTY: 703– 
883–4056. 

Ashley Waldron, 
Secretary to the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2024–01771 Filed 1–25–24; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 6705–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–1147; FR ID 198607] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 

Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before March 29, 
2024. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Nicole Ongele, FCC, via email PRA@
fcc.gov and to nicole.ongele@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Nicole 
Ongele, (202) 418–2991. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The FCC 
may not conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information unless it displays a 
currently valid control number. No 
person shall be subject to any penalty 
for failing to comply with a collection 
of information subject to the PRA that 
does not display a valid Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) control 
number. 

OMB Control Number: 3060–1147. 
Title: Wireless E911 Phase II Location 

Accuracy Requirements (Third Report 
and Order in PS Docket No. 07–114). 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit, State, Local or Tribal 
Government, and Federal Government. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 4,104 respondents; 4,272 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 1 
hour–8 hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this collection is contained 
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